

- AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES:**
- TIRE INSPECTION & REPAIR
 - WHEEL ROTATION & BALANCING
 - HUNTER ROAD FORCE BALANCING
 - BRAKE SERVICE



- AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES:**
- NEW AND USED TIRES
 - HUNTER ALIGNMENT SERVICE
 - OIL & LUBE SERVICE
 - RADIATOR & COOLANT SERVICE

200 WINCHESTER DR. • SEDALIA, MO 65301 • (660) 829-0811 • Fax (660) 829-0855

February 21, 2019

Pettis County Sherriff's Department Sealed Bid – Vehicle Services & Repair

Attn: Pettis County Commission & Sheriff Kevin Bond

Gentlemen,

Thank you once again for the opportunity to provide our products and services to you. Like always, we look forward to providing you with a premium level of service that you expect in maintaining your fleet. Below are outlined each specification that we are prepared to submit for the 2019 bid award year.

Specification 1.

No Bid Submitted

Specification 2.

Speed Rated All-Season Automotive Tires

| Size | Brand | Series | Speed Rating | Price |
|------------------------|---------------|------------------------|--------------|-----------|
| 235/55R17 | B.F. Goodrich | G-Force Comp-2 A/S | W(168 mph) | \$ 90.85 |
| **45,000 mile warranty | | | | |
| 225/60R16 | B.F. Goodrich | Advantage T/A Sport | V(149 mph) | \$ 84.53 |
| **60,000 mile warranty | | | | |
| 265/60R17 | B.F. Goodrich | Advantage T/A Sport LT | V(149 mph) | \$ 127.13 |

All-Weather Tires

| | | | | |
|------------------------|---------------|------------------------|------------|-----------|
| P265/70R17 | B.F. Goodrich | Advantage T/A Sport LT | All-Season | \$ 114.55 |
| **60,000 mile warranty | | | | |
| P235/70R16 | B.F. Goodrich | Advantage T/A Sport LT | All-Season | \$ 94.01 |
| **60,000 mile warranty | | | | |
| LT265/70R17 | B.F. Goodrich | Commercial T/A A/S2 | All-Season | \$162.74 |
| **60,000 mile warranty | | | | |
| LT245/75R16 | B.F. Goodrich | Commercial T/A A/S2 | All-Season | \$135.88 |
| **60,000 mile warranty | | | | |
| LT235/85R16 | B.F. Goodrich | Commercial T/A A/S2 | All-Season | \$127.19 |
| **60,000 mile warranty | | | | |
| LT285/75R16 | Michelin | Defender LTX | All-Season | \$162.23 |
| **70,000 mile warranty | | | | |
| P205/75R15 | Uniroyal | Tiger Paw AWP 3 | All-Season | \$ 66.75 |
| **65,000 mile warranty | | | | |

Labor Costs

| | |
|---------------|--------|
| Mounting | \$7.00 |
| Balancing | \$9.00 |
| Valve Stem | FREE |
| Tire Rotation | FREE |

By signing, I hereby authorize the repair work above to be done along with the necessary material and hereby grant you and/or your employees permission to operate the vehicle herein described on streets, highways, or elsewhere for the purpose of testing and/or inspection. An express mechanic's lien is hereby acknowledged on above vehicle to secure the amount of repairs thereto. Jim's Tire will not be held responsible for loss or damage to vehicle or articles left in vehicle in case of fire, theft, accident, or any other cause beyond our control.



AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES:

- TIRE INSPECTION & REPAIR
- WHEEL ROTATION & BALANCING
- HUNTER ROAD FORCE BALANCING
- BRAKE SERVICE



AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES:

- NEW AND USED TIRES
- HUNTER ALIGNMENT SERVICE
- OIL & LUBE SERVICE
- RADIATOR & COOLANT SERVICE

200 WINCHESTER DR. • SEDALIA, MO 65301 • (660) 829-0811 • Fax (660) 829-0855

| | |
|---------------|---------|
| Tire Repair | \$10.00 |
| Tire Disposal | FREE |

Tires for trailers and other support vehicles will be provided from our on-hand inventory

Specification 3.

Department Vehicle service ALWAYS will be held as a PRIORITY status and will begin within 15 minutes of arrival

| | |
|---|---------|
| Lube, Oil, & Filter Service (<i>Non-Dexos</i>) | \$29.99 |
| Lube, Oil, & Filter Service (<i>Dexos 6 qt</i>) | \$33.95 |
| Lube, Oil, & Filter Service (<i>Dexos 8 qt</i>) '15 and newer Tahoe | \$38.96 |
| Air Filter Replacement | \$13.95 |
| Fuel Filter Replacement | \$22.95 |

Lube, Oil, & Filter Services include top off of fluids, RAIN-X windshield treatment, a 23 point inspection of the vehicles critical components and systems. Message indicators will be reset at the time of service.

Specification 4.

A. Front Brake Service including Refinishing of Rotors* \$89.95

B. Rear Brake Service including Refinishing of Drums/Rotors* \$89.95

**This includes installation of only police spec. brake pads/shoes, relubrication of system components, performance test, drum hardware replacement if applicable, and evaluation of system components.*

C. Front Brake Rotor Refinishing Only** \$55.95

D. Rear Brake Drum/Rotor Refinishing Only** \$55.95

**This includes removal of drum/rotor, visual inspection, deglazing brake pads/shoes, lubrication of system components, performance test, drum hardware replacement if applicable, & evaluation of system components.*

E. Replace Front Pads Only† \$55.95

F. Replace Rear Pads/Shoes Only† \$55.95

†This includes installation of only police spec. brake pads/shoes, relubrication of components, performance test, drum hardware replacement if applicable, inspection & evaluation of system components.

Specification 5.

Transmission Fluid/Filter Service \$79.95

Transmission In-Line Flush Service* \$69.95

**This service includes the use of cleaning additives and allows for a complete system*

By signing, I hereby authorize the repair work above to be done along with the necessary material and hereby grant you and/or your employees permission to operate the vehicle herein described on streets, highways, or elsewhere for the purpose of testing and/or inspection. An express mechanic's lien is hereby acknowledged on above vehicle to secure the amount of repairs thereto. Jim's Tire will not be held responsible for loss or damage to vehicle or articles left in vehicle in case of fire, theft, accident, or any other cause beyond our control.



- AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES:**
- TIRE INSPECTION & REPAIR
 - WHEEL ROTATION & BALANCING
 - HUNTER ROAD FORCE BALANCING
 - BRAKE SERVICE



- AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES:**
- NEW AND USED TIRES
 - HUNTER ALIGNMENT SERVICE
 - OIL & LUBE SERVICE
 - RADIATOR & COOLANT SERVICE

200 WINCHESTER DR. • SEDALIA, MO 65301 • (660) 829-0811 • Fax (660) 829-0855

cleaning/flush.

Specification 6.

| | |
|---|---------|
| Cooling System Flush/Fill Service | \$44.95 |
| Cooling System Pressure Flush Service* | \$59.95 |
| *This service includes the use of cleaning & system performance enhancing additives | |

Specification 7.

| | |
|---|---------|
| Vehicle Tune-Up Service (All Vehicles) | \$99.95 |
|---|---------|

Specification 8.

| | |
|---|---------|
| Complete Air Conditioning Service | \$79.95 |
| <i>Evacuate, Recharge, Pressure & Performance Test, Leak Test, Oil with Dye added</i> | |
| Air Conditioning Performance / Pressure Test | FREE |

Specification 9.

| | | |
|-------------------|---------------|---------|
| Minor Repair Rate | <i>Hourly</i> | \$55.00 |
| Parts Cost plus | | 20% |

Specification 10.

| | | |
|-------------------|---------------|---------|
| Major Repair Rate | <i>Hourly</i> | \$65.00 |
| Parts Cost Plus | | 20% |

Specification 11.

| | |
|---------------------|---------|
| Front End Alignment | \$45.95 |
|---------------------|---------|

Specification 12.

No Bid Submitted

Specification 13.

| | | |
|---|---|----------|
| Battery Service | <i>Interstate 72 month Battery installation</i> | \$140.95 |
| Battery Terminal Cleaning & Performance Testing | | FREE |

Specification 14.

| | | |
|------------------------|---------------------|---------|
| Four – Wheel Alignment | <i>All Vehicles</i> | \$45.95 |
|------------------------|---------------------|---------|

By signing, I hereby authorize the repair work above to be done along with the necessary material and hereby grant you and/or your employees permission to operate the vehicle herein described on streets, highways, or elsewhere for the purpose of testing and/or inspection. An express mechanic's lien is hereby acknowledged on above vehicle to secure the amount of repairs thereto. Jim's Tire will not be held responsible for loss or damage to vehicle or articles left in vehicle in case of fire, theft, accident, or any other cause beyond our control.



AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES:

- TIRE INSPECTION & REPAIR
- WHEEL ROTATION & BALANCING
- HUNTER ROAD FORCE BALANCING
- BRAKE SERVICE



AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES:

- NEW AND USED TIRES
- HUNTER ALIGNMENT SERVICE
- OIL & LUBE SERVICE
- RADIATOR & COOLANT SERVICE

200 WINCHESTER DR. • SEDALIA, MO 65301 • (660) 829-0811 • Fax (660) 829-0855

Specification 15.

No Bid Submitted

Specification 16.

No Bid Submitted

Jim's Express Tires & Automotive Service

200 Winchester Drive
Sedalia, MO 65301

660-829-0811
660-620-5859 *Emergency*

Hours of Operation

Monday – Friday
7:30 a.m. - 5:30 p.m.
Saturday
7:30 a.m. - 1:00 p.m.

Thank you again for reviewing our submission to provide products and services to the Pettis County Sheriff's Department. All of our work carries a 36 month, 36,000 mile nation-wide warranty. I have also included my personal mobile phone number in the event of an emergency relating to our field. We appreciate the department's service to the public and look forward to serving you.

Thank You,

Chad Crystal
Manager
Jim's Express Tires & Automotive Service
200 Winchester Drive
Sedalia, MO 65301

Office (660)829-0811
 Mobile (660)620-5859
 Fax (660)829-0855
 Email chad@jimstireexpress.com

